

FOI 11611 - West Mercia - Stalking

2) Cautions raised for Stalking

Cautions shown by Gender of Suspect

	Female	Male	Total
2013	0	2	2
2014	1	2	3
2015	0	2	2
2016	0	5	5
2017	0	2	2
2018	0	5	5
Total	1	18	19

Cautions shown by Gender of Victim

	Female	Male	Total
2013	2	0	2
2014	2	1	3
2015	2	0	2
2016	4	1	5
2017	2	0	2
2018	5	0	5
Total	17	2	19

3) Arrests made for allegations of stalking

Arrests shown by Gender of Suspect

	Female	Male	Total
2013	2	6	8
2014	1	12	13
2015	0	20	20
2016	0	17	17
2017	3	45	48
2018	3	63	66
Total	9	163	172

Arrests Shown by Gender of Victim

	Female	Male	Total
2013	Data not recorded on Custody System		0
2014	Data not recorded on Custody System		0
2015	Data not recorded on Custody System		0

2016	Data not recorded on Custody System		0
2017	31	4	35
2018	61	8	69
Total	92	12	104

Data recorded since 4 October 2017

There is sometimes more than 1 victim recorded against an arrest

4) Cases referred to CPS (Data recorded since 4 October 2017)

Cases shown by Gender of Defendant

	Female	Male	Total
2017	0	19	19
2018	3	59	62
Total	3	78	81

Cases shown by Gender of Victim

	Female	Male	Total
2017	18	1	19
2018	60	4	64
Total	78	5	83

There is sometimes more than 1 victim recorded on a case

5) Number of Cases where CPS advised no further action (Data recorded since 4 October 2017)

Cases shown by Gender of Defendant

	Female	Male	Total
2017	0	9	9
2018	2	24	26
Total	2	33	35

Cases shown by Gender of Victim

	Female	Male	Total
2017	8	1	9
2018	25	3	28
Total	33	4	37

There is sometimes more than 1 victim recorded on a case